

Florida A & M University
 700 Bed Residence Hall Ph II
 BID TABULATION SHEET
 Oct 3, 2024 @ 2:00 PM EST

FAMU Project BRFM359 - Furniture

Respondent

	Base bid	Study lounge	Activity lounge	First lounge	Coordinator apartment	Total
ULC*	\$ 1,076,026.00					\$ 1,076,026.00
Savoy**	\$ 963,032.05					\$ 963,032.05
Function First***	\$ 1,400,788.11					\$ 1,400,788.11
Southwest	\$ 851,172.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 851,172.00
Foliot	\$ 767,706.00	\$ 31,411.00	\$ 33,387.00	\$ 54,819.00	\$ 27,174.00	\$ 914,497.00
CDS	\$ 2,258,246.34	\$ 586,483.40				\$ 2,844,729.74
Transformations		\$ 137,168.37				\$ 137,168.37

ULC Student rooms + Staff apartment
 Savoy All inclusive
 Function First All inclusive

David Rosenfeld 10/15/2024

Craig Talton 10/15/2024

Shawn Brien 10/16/2024

Herbert Johnson 10/16/2024