Docusign Envelope ID: 249CB098-D1D8-4715-A5EB-0F5A0662D8BF

Florida A & M University
700 Bed Residence Hall Ph I
BID TABULATION SHEET
Oct 3,2024 @ 2:00 PM EST
FAMU Project BRFM359 - Furniture

Respondent
. - ) Coordinator
Base bid Study lounge  Activity lounge First lounge Total
apartment
uLc* $ 1,076,026.00 $ 1,076,026.00
Savoy** $ 963,032.05 $ 963,032.05
Function First*** $ 1,400,788.11 $ 1,400,788.11
Southwest $ 851,172.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 851,172.00
Foliot $ 767,706.00 $ 31,411.00 $ 33,387.00 $54,819.00 $ 27,174.00 $ 914,497.00
CDS $ 2,258,246.34 $ 586,483.40 $ 2,844,729.74
Transformations $ 137,168.37 $ 137,168.37
ULC Studentrooms + Staff apartment
Savoy Allinculsive
Function First  Allinculsive
David Rosenfeld 10/15/2024

Cm? Taltow. 10/15/2024

NIRWCH 10/16/2024

Herbeit Johnson 10/16/2024


david.rosenfeld
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